* Roll Call Number

Agenda Item Number

A

An Ordinance entitled, "AN ORDINANCE to amend the Municipal Code of the City of Des
Moines, Iowa, 2000, adopted by Ordinance No. 13,827, passed June 5, 2000, as
heretofore amended, by amending Sections 46-1, 46-3, 46-3.07, 46-61, 46-62, 46-63, 46-
64, 46-73, 46-247, 46-281, 46-316 and 46-318, and adding and enacting new Sections 46-
74 and 46-75, and by repealing Sections 46-68, 46-69, 46-70, 46-72, 46-246 and 46-249,
relating to adoption of the international fire code and amendments and additions thereto",

which was considered and voted upon for the first time under Roll Call No. 13- l / 70
of July 15, 2013, and considered and voted upon for the second time under Roll Call No.

13-_] 219 of July 29, 2013, again presented.
Moved by that this ordinance do now pass.
ORDINANCE NO.
COUNCIL ACTION | YEAS | NAYS | PASS | ABSENT CERTIFICATE
COWNIE
COLEMAN I, DIANE RAUH, City Clerk of said City hereby
GRIESS certify that at a meeting of the City Council of
said City of Des Moines, held on the above date,
HENSLEY among other proceedings the above was adopted.
MAHAFFEY
MEYER IN WITNESS WHEREOF, 1 have hereunto set my
hand and affixed my seal the day and year first
MOORE above written. :
TOTAL
MOTION CARRIED APPROVED

Mayor

City Clerk




Date: | July 15, 2013

CO“I]Cil Agenda Item No. 55A
13=HG0
13,378

» o Roll Call No.
: Communication | communication No.
Office of the City Manager Submitted by: John F. TeKippe,
Fire Chief
AGENDA HEADING:

Amending Chapter 46 of the Municipal Code relating to adoption of the International Fire Code and
amendments and additions thereto.

SYNOPSIS:

Recommend approval of this Ordinance which amends Sections 46-1, 46-3, 46-3.07, 46-61, 46-62, 46-
63, 46-64, 46-73, 46-247, 46-281, 46-316, and 46-318, and enacts new Sections 46-74 and 46-75, all of
Chapter 46, Fire Protection and Prevention of the Municipal Code of the City of Des Moines.
Approval of this Ordinance also deletes Sections 46-68, 46-69, 46-70, 46-72, 46-246, and 46-249. The
change to Section 46-61 is to replace the 7009 edition of the International Fire Code by adopting the
more recent 2012 edition of the International Fire Code. The other changes to Chapter 46 are intended
to reflect changes between the 2009 edition and the 2012 edition of the International Fire Code, and to
provide the Fire Department with supplemental options for enforcement of the Fire Prevention Code.

FISCAL IMPACT: NONE

ADDITIONAL INFORMATION:

The Municipal Code of the City of Des Moines adopts and incorporates the International Fire Code as
published by the International Code Council, which is historically updated every three (3) years. The
International Fire Code “is a model code that regulates minimum fire safety requirements for new and
existing buildings, facilities, storage, and processes” and is historically updated every three (3) years to
incorporate technological advances and best practices in fire protection, prevention, and inspection. In
conjunction with the adoption of the 2012 edition of the International Fire Code, the amendments,
additions, and deletions to the Municipal Code of Des Moines must also be updated by ordinance to
correlate with the new edition. The proposed ordinance also adds new requirements regarding
securing of fire-damaged buildings following fire events.

The proposed revisions to Chapter 46 include, but are not limited to, the following:

Des Moines Municipal Code Section 46-1. Permits Required.

The proposed revisions to Section 46-1 reflect the renumbering of chapters and sections of the 2012
edition of the International Fire Code, and incorporate new permitting requirements found in said

edition. :

Des Moines Municipal Code Sections 46-3, 46-3.07, and 46-64. Violations; notice of violation —
administrative penalties — corrective action order; appeals.



Council Communication No. 13-378
Page 2 of 5

The proposed revisions add the option for the Fire Department to pursue nuisance or other legal
remedies for violations of Chapter 46, in addition to misdemeanor and municipal infraction charges.

Des Moines Municipal Code Section 46-61. Adoption of International Fire Code.

The proposed ordinance replaces the outdated 2009 edition of the International Fire Code with the
2012 edition of the International Fire Code.

Des Moines Municipal Code Section 46-62. Deletions.

The following sections of the 2012 Edition of the International Fire Code are deleted and replaced
elsewhere in the Municipal Code of the City of Des Moines or were not recommended for adoption by
the Building and Fire Code Board of Appeals:

Section 113 — fees

Section 307 - open buming, recreational fires, and portable outdoor fireplaces
Section 510.3 — permit required for emergency responder radio coverage
Section 2006.5.4 — aircraft fueling vehicles — transfer personnel

Section 3104.15.5 and 3104.15.6 — cooking tents and outdoor cooking
Appendix A — Board of Appeals

While the aforementioned list is not all inclusive, it highlights some of the International Fire Code
requirements that have been deleted.

Des Moines Municipal Code Section 46-63. Amendments and additions.

Open Flames in Residential Occupancies. Section 308.1.4 is deleted and replaced with Section 46-66
and 46-67. Section 46-66 limits the use of charcoal burners and other ash/ember producing cooking
devices to one (1) and two (2) family dwellings and Section 46-67 allows the use of LPG (liquid
propane gas) fueled cooking devices in multi-family dwellings with certain restrictions and safeguards.

Securing Fire Damaged Premises within 48 hours — Section 46-74. Section 46-74 establishes that the
new requirement that within 48 hours of a fire event, and upon determination of the fire department
official that the fire-damaged structure in an unsecured condition may constitute a hazard and
emergency nuisance condition, a fire damaged structure must be secured by the property owner. If the
property owners £ails ‘to secure the fire-damaged property (or have the fire-damaged property secured
at the owner’s expense including by homeowner’s insurance coverage), the Fire Chief or designee may
cause the fire-damageéd structure to be secured and assess the costs against the property in the same
manner as a property tax, pursuant to the procedures set forth in article VI, chapter 42 of the City
Code. Rather than creating a new preferred vendor contract process for securing fire-damaged
structures, the Fire Department will utilize the Building Department’s contracted preferred vendor for
commercial structures and the preferred vendor on contract with the Neighborhood Inspection Division
will be used for residential structures.

Fire Escape Examination for Structural Integrity — incorporated by adoption of 2012 edition of
International Fire Code (Section 46-61). Section 1104.16.5 of the 2012 International Fire Code
requires fire escape stairs and balconies to be examined for structural adequacy and safety by a
registered design professional or others acceptable to the fire code official every five (5) years, or as
required by the fire code official. The reason for this change is that building fire escapes are a means
of egress component in many existing multiple-story buildings. The evaluation of fire escapes is



Council Communication No. 13-378
Page 3 of 5

necessary to confirm that this exterior stair egress component satisfies a minimum design load, is
properly maintained, and is available for service in the event of an emergency.

Appendices B, C, and D. Appendix B — Fire Flow Requirements for Buildings, Appendix C - Fire
Hydrant Locations and Distribution, and Appendix D — Fire Apparatus Access Road Requirements
establish minimum fire protection features that previously were referenced during project review by
the Fire Department. The Building and Fire Code Board of Appeals recommends formally adopting

these appendices since they are currently being required and enforced during project reviews.

Emergency Responder Radio Coverage — Section 46-73(b). Sections 510.1 and 1103.2 of the 2012
edition of the International Fire Code require that emergency responders must be capable of effectively
communicating in new and existing buildings when using emergency portable radios. The
communication challenges experienced during the September 11th World Trade Center tragedy
prompted this fire code change. In situations where the design or construction features of the buildings
do not allow for effective radio transmission/reception, the owner of the building is required to install
bi-directional amplifiers or other upgrades to achieve compliance. The Des Moines Fire Department
has been conducting field radio tests and preliminary results suggest that fewer than 50 buildings will
be impacted. There are financial implications for those buildings that fail the field radio test and
require further testing and system up grades. Pursuant to the proposed revisions to add Section 46-
73(b), once notified, building owners will have three (3) years (with a possible two (2) year extension)
to comply with the Emergency Responder Radio Coverage requirement.

Carbon Monoxide Alarms in Institutional and Residential Buildings incorporated by adoption 0f 2012
edition of International Fire Code (Section 46-61). Sections 908.7 and 1103.9 of the 2012
International Fire Code address carbon monoxide issues and require carbon monoxide alarms to be
installed in new and existing institutional and residential occupancies. This requirement will require
enforcement coordination between the Fire Department, Building Department and Neighborhood
Inspection Division, but the benefit of detecting deadly carbon monoxide gas is indisputable. The
financial impact to property owners is minimal.

PREVIOUS COUNCIL ACTION(S):
Date: December 20, 2010

Roll Call Number: 10-2100

Action: Amending Chapter 26 of the Municipal Code to adopt the 2009 editions of the International
Building Code; International Residential Code; International Existing Building Code; International
Mechanical Code; International Fuel Gas Code; International Energy Conservation Code and Uniform
Plumbing Code — as amended by changing Section 26-328 and 26-329 to address concerns raised by
local homebuilders. (Council Communication No. 10-764) Moved by Hensley that this ordinance do
now pass, #14.981. Motion Carried 7-0.

Date: December 6, 2010

Roll Call Number: 10-2014 and 10-2015

Action: Amending Chapter 26 of the Municipal Code to adopt the 2009 editions of the International
Building Code; International Residential Code; International Existing Building Code; International




Council Communication No. 13-378
Page 4 of 5

Mechanical Code; International Fuel Gas Code; International Energy Conservation Code and Uniform
Plumbing Code — as amended by changing Section 26- 328 and 26-329 to address concerns raised by
local homebuilders. Moved by Hensley that this ordinance be considered and given second vote for
passage. Motion Carried 6-1. Nays: Moore.

(A) Amendment to the Schedule of Fees. ( Council Communication No. 10-715) Moved by
Hensley to adopt. Motion Carried 6-1. Nays: Moore.

Date: November 22, 2010

Roll Call Number: 10-1959, 10-1960 and 10-1961

Action: On Amendment of Chapter 26 of the Municipal Code to adopt the 2009 editions of the
International Building Code; International Residential Code; International Existing Building Code;
International Mechanical Code; International Fuel Gas Code; International Energy Conservation Code
and the Uniform Plumbing Code. (Council Communication No. 10-704) Moved by Hensley to adopt.
Motion Carried 6-1. Nays: Moore.

(A) First consideration of ordinance above. Moved by Hensley that this ordinance be
considered and given first vote for passage on all sections, excluding Sections 26- 328 and 26-
399 of the International Residential Code; refer those sections to the City Manager for review
and recommendation regarding how suburbs are handling sprinklers. Motion Carried 6-1.
Nays: Moore.

(B) First consideration of ordinance on amendment of Chapter 46 of the Municipal Code
regarding adoption of the International Fire Code and amendments and additions. (Council
Communication No. 10-689) Moved by Hensley that this ordinance be considered and given
first vote for passage. Motion Carried 6-1. Nays: Moore.

Date: July 23,2007

Roll Call Number: 07-1431 and 07-1432

Action: Amending Chapter 46 of the Municipal Code regarding the following:

(A) Fire Prote-;:tion and Prevention Code. Moved by Coleman that this ordinance be considered
and given first vote for passage. Motion Carried 7-0.

(B) Adoption of the International Fire Code and amendments and additions to International Fire
Code. (Council Communication No. 07-424) Moved by Cole that this ordinance be considered
and given first vote for passage. Motion Carried 7-0.

BOARD/COMMISSION ACTION(S):
Board: Building and Fire Code Board of Appeals
Date: May 9, 2013

Resolution Number: N/A




Council Communication No. 13-378
Page 5 of 5

Action: Motion to recommend Council adopt the 2012 editions of the Uniform Plumbing Code,
International Mechanical Code, International Fuel Gas Code, International Residential Code,
International Building Code, International Existing Building Code, and the International Fire Code
with amendments as proposed by the Building and Fire Code Board of Appeals. Motion carried 9-1
(Martie Mendenhall opposed).

ANTICIPATED ACTIONS AND FUTURE COMMITMENTS: NONE

For more information on this and other agenda items, please call the City Clerk’s Office at 515-283-4209 or visit the
Clerk’s Office on the first floor of City Hall, 400 Robert D. Ray Drive. Council agendas are available to the public at the
City Clerk’s Office on Thursday afternoon preceding Monday’s Council meeting. Citizens can also request 1o receive
meeting notices and agendas by email by calling the Clerk’s Office or sending their request via email to
cityclerk@dmgov.org.



130140
7

ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE to amend the Municipal Code of the City of Des Moines,
Towa, 2000, adopted by Ordinance No. 13,827, passed June 3,
2000, as heretofore amended, by amending Sections 46-1, 46-3,
46-3.07, 46-61, 46-62, 46-63, 46-64, 46-73, 46-247, 46-281,
46-316 and 46-318, and adding and enacting new Sections 46-74
and 46-75, and by repealing Sections 46-68, 46-69, 46-70, 46-
72, 46-246 and 46-249, relating to adoption of the
international fire code and amendments and additions thereto.

Be It Ordained by the City Council of the City of Des Moines, Iowa:

Section 1. That the Municipal Code of the City of Des Moines,
Towa, 2000, adopted by Ordinance No. 13,827, passed June 5, 2000,
as heretofore amended, is hereby amended by amending Sections 46-1,
46~3, 46-3.07, 46-61, 46-62, 46-63, 46-64, 46-73, 46-247, 46-281,
46-316 and 46-318, and adding and enacting new Sections 46-74 and
46-75, and by repealing Sections 46-68, 46-69, 46-70, 46-72, 46-246
and 46-249, relating to adoption of the international fire code and
amendments and additions thereto, as follows:

ARTICLE I. IN GENERAL

Sec. 46-1. Permits required.

(a) It shall be unlawful for any person to use a building or
premises or engage in any activities for which a permit 1is
required by this chapter without first having obtained such
permit. Permits are required from the fire prevention bureau
for the uses listed in subsections (b) through (h) of this
section.

(b) Permits shall be required for each of the following
installations, and the fee for each such installation shall be
the amount established in the schedule of fees adopted by the
city council by resolution:

(1) Compressed and liquefied petroleum gas system (see
section 46-278 of this chapter).



(2)

Flammable or combustible 1liquid tanks (see section
105.7.8 of the fire code—46-246——ocf this—chapter).

Yearly operational permits shall be required for each of the
following facilities or uses, and the fee for each such
installation or use shall be the amount established in the
schedule of fees adopted by the city council by resolution:

(1)

(2)

Aviation Facility. To use a Group H or Group S for
aircraft servicing or repair and aircraft fuel-servicing
vehicles (see chapter 3320 of the fire code) .
Acetylene generator. To 65€Eate an acetylene generator
having a carbide capacity of five pounds or greater (see
section 46-121 of this chapter).

Calcium carbide. To store or keep calcium carbide in

excess of 100 pounds (see section 46-121 of this chapter)

Cellulose nitrate film. To store, handle, or use nitrate

film in quantities in excess of five reels or 25 pounds

in weight (see section 306 of the fire code)

Cellulose nitrate (pyroxylin).

a. To store or handle more than 25 pounds of cellulose
nitrate plastic (see section 306 of the fire code).

b. To manufacture or assemble pyroxylin articles or
parts of (see chapter 42-65 of the fire code).

Combustible fiber. To store or handle combustible fibers

in quantities in excess of 100 cubic feet (see chapter 28

52 of the fire code).

Compressed gases. To store, handle or use at normal

temperatures and pressures in excess of quantities

indicated:

a. Flammable gases in excess of 278868-200 cubic feet
(see chapter 3558 of the fire code).

b. Nenflammable—Inert and simple asphyxiant gases in
excess of 6,000 cubic feet (see chapter 36—53 of
the fire code). o

c. Oxidizing gases in excess of 37866504 cubic feet
(see chapter 40-63 of the fire code). '

d. Corrosive or toxic in—excess—ef 1,000 —ecuvbic—feek
gases in any amount (see chapter 27-50 of the fire
code) .

e. Highly toxic, radioactive or reactive (unstable) =
excess ofF 500 cubic feetmaterials in any amount
(see chapter 3760 and 43 66 of the fire code)

[ALL S TN
Ty o

o ‘Fcﬂr\rjhl o
A=y =

0]

d el
<

D qt|®

L

Q.
d

asvwooant LR
2< P v

\

o
ato R0

p

I,J.
VR Y]

e
+

- g

Y
b
i
!
]

{]

[l v Y]

R}
qt

b
bk @ D

b O ©

L O]
Hh

P dn

© P

)}
nd P
4t Hh qt g
H MO
O th
o) H
IR}
)

D

(6]



4
oIt

T e /AN o n
v o =

Dry cleaning plants. To engage in the business of dry
cleaning, as prescribed by class or type of system (see
chapter 3221 of the fire code).

(10) Dust-producing operations. To operate a grain elevator;
flour, starch or feed mill; or plant pulverizing
aluminum, coal, cocoa, magnesium, spices, sugar or other
material producing dusts as defined in chapter 22-22 of
the fire code.

(11) Activities or uses involving explosives or blasting
agents. (see chapter 32-56 of the fire code):

a. Keep, store or sell explosives.
b. Transport explosives.
C. Blasting using explosives.

(12) Activities or wuses involving explosives, small arms
ammunition, small arms primers, smokeless propellants,
black rifle powder (see chapter 23-56 of the fire code):
a. Small arms ammunition, to store or sell.

b. Small arms primers and smokeless propellants, to
store or sell.
C. Black rifle powder, to store or sell.

(13) Inspection, maintenance and certification of fire
appliances.

(14) Operation for conducting a fireworks display (see section
46-214 of this chapter).

(15) Conducting a flammable finish operation by painting,
spraying, dipping or storing flammable products for these
operations (see chapter 1524 of the fire code).

(16) Flammable or combustible liquids_(see section 105.6.16 of
fire code).
= T~ ot o e e MR oW oar 1o af £l ammoai Ar
TLA - E A ul_v.n_u\j T ;1@1&\,«.4..4_;;\_1 e = R =y —]——]—ulLuLllA‘M.J_ ey

combateatralla 19 et e ez ~1 e [~ cormtiarn ACaDA0
oo o TR T Ty =y | B g e S w e e ) (AR ey e o 3 QI A e v
of +hia ~homt s
of-this chapteri—
b Retail-dealers—in—flommable or—combustiblediguids
leomas cnhoammts s ACDAE (DN Af +hao ~Ahard s
I WA I~ s g AR S S e S S S A A L R X e~ TITOo o T T -
o Srtaf o mdeag g e 1ol ey £l ammall Aar combinictr ikl A
A LJLALJ.&A.J_UV&_LAJ_-‘Lll\j uU—LAA\j T CITHTICO A O N LT ST 9 B N g gy e a e i S

(17) Fruit ripening. To ripen fruit by the process described
in chapter 16-25 of the fire code using ethylene gas.

(18) Garages. To use any structure as a place of business for
repairing motor vehicles (see chapter 22-23 of the fire
code) .

(19) Hazardeus—chemicals—Testore—or handle—the—follewing
hazardous—chemicals—in excess—of —guantities andicated
[, ochamt - 27 ~f + faire A
T CriaptTtoeT =7 = | S I o s ng Y oo
=S Corrosives —in—excess—ef—10—gallens r—1-008

nr\'n'hr“]c
peuRas



cvenca ~F TAON yasam e
A == -~ = A4 r/ CAT T »

n

3
1T

acrnldide
[CA=peuys w sy

0l ~mrab ]~
a3 3eh 25 5 S 4 oxS

ry

4
TIT

neotd e~ A
PSSt GeSs

Al
TITIE

- e WA
CAN iAo

af B0~ ~me

14~ A

sz
ToITT T

Do ~h sz
IEESCEE =07

Fd =T EaC e

otk
P T

pyy=;

EN—AA..J_
Tarnotalkla

~
TITI o T

T

et Falalallal
T T ToT

o
Tz

ol A
[ g S S

Wl il Wb
v

A
O

it e
LA R =

~
o

Osza A3 53 e
X e o

T

~laea
L -y e e g

72 A e
T OZT T X

b B s W . e . W W S o W S ]
ST TP

A [
TXTTTH PO iy

2

ol e
Ly ng oy g

15 i1 A
TS T

ol 1l Aano
SRS A T I

meannAe [FES ara
o = i A= S

of EO

v TT v A~~~
o - L P =y LR TT

vt g v

or
E=

PN I L
[ g gy g vy

[ o e o

LIt oy
W oo =

9
Ly

ot o]~
KT o TaoIey

T W d

S ma - oy ST ]

[aYVENE

OYror oy a o
AR R R

~l oo
L ey e e

]
=

A s A
PEECH TS

-
=

2

o
T

4
T

~loac e
oo

12 ~11a e
TSIy

T

g

| >eaw gy

I
cheome ~=1 o

EOO metirmAe FBEE ~oT1 ] Arnae

~
o
=

Ay T 97 s~ oo
Tt T+ =< oA

ITTT
g g

P o
Loy

[l i S aliee Wa 2y
S=oEaS

e
e iy

af hoaoowAasa
TG o Ao ot To HeinTrooTo

el ol o
=

~4

D121 1
e e

aAavoano o
ST oD

n

ot ion 3
- L

+hae oialba
f S apr iy e T AT S e iy v Gy

.
ey

3

1 eotad
P DA By i WP W N

cheomt ~= ] o
FYqu g e e

TTT

+hea
L v N o )

e y o s vy

Tact oA wemamrma b
[ S Sy e N t/

~
~ T
=

oy

N ATATA N VN Y. Vo o

£
=

Af maase
A" S Y

falkh i ath alaWa dnl
JL\/J—‘A\:’\/

Rl -
IS

~n ey
T e

micaosl ] arn
TIT A w7 S e Shgen sy 49 s R 1 N

RalkalWa Fal
T g7

ot
S

Ri1llk
g aw ge =)

Yool yayey o

-

L NN )
P34 4 g o s s g - e

clnoano £ haoarAniig ot

+haor 412
CTICATT

L=

R T 3

To store or handle

PRI arap e gt agy o g g gy

o

permit-—Hazardous chemicals.

=W

the following hazardous chemicals in excess of the

(see Chapter 50 of the fire

dicated

in

guantities
code

see 105.6.16

Combustible liguids -

Corrosive liguids — 55 gallons

Corrosive solids

1000 pounds

see 105.6.16
100 pounds

Flammable ligquids

Flammable solids

Highly toxic liguids and solids - any amounts

Toxic liguids - 10 gallons

Toxic solids

100 pounds

Organic Peroxides

Ligquilds - Class I and II — any amount

Liguids — Class III - 1 gallon

guids - Class IV - 2 gallons

i
Ligquids - Class V — no permit required

L

— any amount

Class I and II
Solids - Class III - 10 pounds

Solids - Class IV - 20 pounds

Solids

Splids - Class V — no permit reguired

Oxidizing materials

Oxidizing gases — any amount

Oxidizing liguids class 4 — any amount

Oxidizing liguids class 3 — 1 gallon

Oxidizing ligquids class 2 — 10 gallons

Oxidizing liguids class 1 — 55 gallons

Oxidizing solids class 4 — any amount




Oxidizing solids class 3 - 10 pounds

Oxidizing solids class 2 - 100 pounds

Oxidizing solids class 1 - 500 pounds

Unstable (reactive) materials
Liguids class 3 & 4 — any amount
Liguids class 2 — 5 gallons
Liguids class 1- 10 gallons
Solids class 3 & 4 — any amount
Solids class 2 - 50 pounds
Solids class 1 — 100 pounds

Water reactive materials
Liguids class 3 - any amount
Liguids class 2 - 5 gallons
Liguids class 1 — 55 gallons
Sclids class 3 - any amount
Solids class 2 — 50 pounds

Solids class 1 — 500 pounds

Liguefied petroleum gas. To operate or maintain an LP gas
system or store LP gas (see section 46-278 of this
chapter).

Lumberyards. To store lumber in excess of 100,000 board
feet (see chapter 3928 of the fire code).

Magnesium. To melt, cast, heat treat or grind more than
ten pounds of magnesium per working day (see chapter 36
59 of the fire code).

Mall, covered. To use a covered mall in the following
manner: placing or constructing temporary kiosks, display
booths, concession equipment or the like in the mall; to
use the mall as a place of assembly; to use open-flame or
flame-producing devices; to display any liquid or gas
fueled powered equipment; to use liguefied natural gas or
compressed flammable gas 30 days only.

Organic coatings. To manufacture more than one gallon of
organic coatings in a working day (see chapter 29 of the
fire code).

Ovens, industrial baking or drying. To operate an
industrial baking or drying oven regulated by this
chapter (see chapter 2%—30 of the fire code).

Al gt -x‘\ \--r:sv-rw-v fala +
=+ =7 3517 =

;
£ this—chapt Reserved
Refrigerant equlpment To operate a refrlgeratlon unit or
system having a refrigerant circuit containing more than
220 pounds (100 kg) of group Al or 30 pounds (14 kg) of
any other group refrigerant.



(d)

(28) Tents. To erect or maintain a tent or alr-supported
structure (see chapter 24-31 of the fire code and article
X of this chapter).

(29) Tire rebuilding. To operate a tire rebuilding or tire
recapping plant (see chapter 25—34 of the fire code).

(30) High piled combustible storage. To use a building or a
portion thereof as a high piled storage area in excess of
500 sguare feet, including storage cof combustible
materials on pallets, in racks or on shelves where the
top of the storage is greater than 12 feet in height, and
also including certain commodities, such as rubber tires,
Group A plastics, flammable ligquids, idle pallets and
similar commodities where the top of the storage is
greater than 6 feet in height (see sections 105.6.22 and
202 of the fire ccde).

A permit shall be required for construction, installation or

modification of the following types of fire protection systems

and equipment, and the fee for issuance of such permit shall

be the amount established in the schedule of fees adopted by

the city council by resolution:+

(1) Automatic fire-extinguishing systems.

2) Ceompressed&a5es ~Reserved.

) Fire alarm and detection systems and related equipment.

)  Fire pumps and related equipment.

)  Flammable—and-cembustibile liguids-Reserved.

(6) Spraying-or-dipping-—Reserved.

A permit shall be required for removal of an underground

storage tank which contains or has contained any substance for

which a permit is reguired under this section_ (see section

105.7.8(3) of the fire code), and the fee for such permit

shall be the amount established in the schedule of fees

adopted by the city council by resolution.

Exemption for certain classes of applicants. Persons

performing work or operations for the federal government or

the state may obtain permits for such work or operations

without paying the permit fees described in this section.

A permit shall be required for open fires or open burns

pursuant to section 46-61. Outdoor fireplaces or grills

burning untreated wood or charcoal used solely for the non-

commercial preparation of food shall not be required to obtain

a permit,

The permit fees required by this section shall be doubled

whenever a permit is not obtained prior to conducting the

activities described in this section. No additional permits

shall be issued to any person who owes the city the double fee

established in this subsection.

(
(
(
(

oY U > W




Sec. 46-3. Violations.

(a) Any person who fails to perform an act required by the
provisions of this chapter, or who commits an act prohibited
by the provisions of this chapter, shall be guilty of a
misdemeanor punishable by fine or impriscnment as provided by
section 1-15, or shall be guilty of a municipal infraction
punishable by a civil penalty as provided by section 1-15.

(b) The fire department may also proceed under public nuisance
provisions set forth in this code, and/or pursue any other
remedy available at law, to address any failure tc perform an
act required by the provisions of this chapter or any action
prohibited by the provisions of this chapter.

Sec. 46-3.07. Notice of violation--administrative penalties--
corrective action order.

(a) The fire department is authorized to issue a notice of
violation imposing administrative penalties upon any person
who fails to perform an act required by chapter 46 of this
code or who commits an act prohibited by said chapter.

(b) Such notice shall include a statement of the administrative
penalties imposed. Such notice may include a corrective
action order regquiring compliance with the violated code
section within thirty (30) days.

(c) The administrative penalty for such violations shall Dbe as
provided in the schedule of administrative penalties adopted
by the city council by resolution.

(d) Notice of violation, with the applicable penalty for such
violation noted thereon, shall be issued to and served upon
the violator. Service of the notice upon the violator may be
by regular mail or by delivery in person.

(e) Penalties assessed pursuant to notice of violation shall be
paid by the violator in full as directed in the notice within
thirty (30) days of its dissuance. Corrective action as
required pursuant to notice of violation shall be completed by
the violator as directed in the notice within thirty (30) days
of its issuance.

(f) The administrative penalties set out in the schedule of
administrative penalties shall be charged in lieu of the fines
and penalties provided for in section 46-3 and 46-3.05, unless
the violator refuses to correct the violation and pay the
scheduled administrative penalty, or the fire chief or the
chief’s authorized representative determines that immediate
enforcement action by misdemeanor or municipal infraction
prosecution pursuant to section 46-3 and 46-3.05, or by public
nuisance procedure or any other remedy available at law, is,
in view of the particular circumstances of the case, necessary
to achieve compliance with the requirements of Chapter—46this
chapter. The fire department shall maintain a record of all




Sec.

Sec.

A9A

violations, administrative penalties charged or ©other
enforcement actiocns taken.

ARTICLE IITI. CODE
46-61. Adoption of international fire code.

This chapter shall consist of the Internaticnal Fire Code,
20062012 edition, published by the International Code
Council, Inc. and known commonly and referenced in this
chapter as the “international fire code” and as the “fire
code”, which volume is incorporated in this ‘seetion—chapter by
this reference as fully as though set forth in this chapter in
its entirety, excepting only such portions as are stated to be
deleted therefrom and such additional provisions as are set
forth in this article.

This chapter and all provisions incorporated in this chapter,
by reference or otherwise, shall be known as the fire
prevention code, may be cited as such, and will be referred to
in this chapter as such and as "this code” or as "this
article" or as "this chapter." Further references made in this
chapter to chapters will be to chapters of the internaticnal
fire code. References to section numbers not preceded by "46-"
will be to sections in the international fire code.

46-62. Deletions.

The following sections are hereby deleted from the

international fire code adopted in section 46-61 of this article
and are of no force or effect in this chapter:

Sec.

(1) Sections 113, 307.1, 307.2, 307.4, 307.4.1, 307.4.2,
307.4.3, 510.3, —3306+-5+4 240415 5 —and 2404 15 ¢
2006.5.4, 3104.15.5 and 3104.15.6.

(2) Appendix A.

1323 Dy hf']xz']'

AT A

46-63. BAmendments and additions.

Article I of this chapter and the remaining sections in this
chapter and in division 2 of article III of chapter 38 of the
city code are and represent amendments and additions to the
requirements contained in the international fire code. Where
their requirements conflict with those of the international
fire code, the requirements of sections 38-81 and 38-82 of the
city Code and articles IV through X of this chapter shall
prevail.

The deleted sections and the corresponding amendments and
additions to those sections are as follows:

(1) Section 108 (see section 46-64 of this chapter).



(2) Section 105, except sections 105.1, 105.6.10, 105.6.16,
105.6.22 and 105.7.8 thereof which are not amended or
deleted and remain incorporated in this chapter (see
section 46-1 of this chapter).

(3) Section 2604-23501.2 (see section 46-121 of this
chapter).

(4) Section 2358-25608.2 (see article VII of this chapter).

(5) Section 3483.45701.4 (see section 46-246 of this

chapter).
(6) Sections 27015001.5, 274035003.9.1, 21935003 9.1.1,
27615001.6.3, 270835001.6, 1015001.5.1 and 5001.5.2

(see article IV of this chapter).

(7) Section 386846104, except Table 6104.3 which 1is not
amended or deleted and remains incorporated in this
chapter (see section 46-281 of this chapter).

(8) Section 308.1.4 (see section 46-66 and 46-67 of this
chapter).

QQ(‘i‘" on :.ﬂ’l ’) 2 (fomao orn~td e /1& ﬂQ r\:F 'é—lﬂwc ﬁhap

o [CATA> ==y = T

)

0} Section 311, except sections 311.2.1, 311.2.2, 311.2.3,
311.5.1, 311.5.2, 311.5.3, 311.5.4, and 311.5.5 thereof which are
not amended or deleted and remain incorporated in this chapter (see
section 46-75 of this chapter) .Seetior 5061 {scesection 46-69 of

qt

i

o
=

\
7

this—chapter—
11} Section 506 11 {sce section 46—70ef this chapteri—
(12} Seection 007 2 10 and 403 Tlsce seckien46~71-of this
(133 Seectien 01231 [(sece sectiA“ 4e~72 of this chapieri
(3410) Sectlon 46@%—A—1101 (see section 46-73 of this
chapter).
(#511) Section 24623-2-3103.2 (see section 46-318 of this
chapter) .

(c) The addition of the following sections/appendices:
(1) Appendixces B, C, D and I.
(2) Section 110.5 (see section 46-74 of this chapter).
(3) Section 311.6 (see section 46-75 of this chapter).

Sec. 46-64. Appeals.

(a) Other than notices of immediate enforcement action by
misdemeanor or municipal infraction prosecution or other
remedies at law, or public nuisance wviolations addressed
through procedures set forth elsewhere in this code, &any
person affected by a decision of the building official or fire
chief or their designee may request and shall be granted a
hearing before the building and fire code board of appeals on
the decision, provided that the person shall file in the
permit and development center a written petition requesting a
hearing and setting forth a brief statement of the grounds
within 15 days after receiving notice of the decision. Upon
receipt of the petition, the permit and development center




shall set a time and place for the hearing and shall give the
petitioner written notice thereof at least three days before
the hearing, unless such notice requirement is waived in
writing by the petitioner. The hearing shall be commenced not
later than thirty days after the day on which the petition was
filed, unless for good cause shown the building official
grants a postponement in writing.

(b} At the hearing the petitioner shall be given an opportunity to
be heard to show why the decision of the building official or
fire chief or designee should be modified or withdrawn. The
building official or fire chief or designee shall have the
opportunity to be heard to show why their decision should be
affirmed.

(c) After the hearing as provided in this section, the building
and fire code board of appeals shall affirm, modify or
withdraw the decision of the building official or fire chief
or designee. The decision of the building and fire code board
of appeals is the final administrative decision.

(d) The proceedings at any hearing before the board, including the
findings and decision of the building official or fire chief
or designee, if applicable, shall be summarized, reduced to
writing, and entered as a matter of public record in the
permit and development center. This record shall include a
copy of every notice or order issued in connection with the
matter.

Sec. 46-68. Repealed by Ord. No. 15,---. Fire apparatus—access

Sec. 46-69. Repealed by Ord. No. 15,--~ Leek bex-

P o LYo STV N baosw +hat ~vveavadt~na tgv4+h A sz ot ey oA~ e
o N IS E R A e S AT oy AT i OpeTrateos—watr—t1t e R S B =A—Ei s act
esr p1ead sy the oo olnoac B9 s lernartment ochal]l e 3med a7 A A~
Y S oYt T o e =T e P e S e Trhocoa T es Tt
o 1] MNALL  ~Aarm ot it g ey s wa ot drmey ot gagetagymean ot o~ ey
o W O St Rt e Rt X S e R S e Rt R et riad v 80 ———tE o8 g—= e
olan IAITT AL My S esao o L) o o romit vy Iy s 1Tre  ~rodds o AFFS ~0 o1
Pt TV WP oo oS — oo Egurroo—o g>rys = oo O
szt 4 o e 1N Cvemagry R el qamm evnggamn ) wvmmagny DD A e g s e D
[=paS Sy = e S ¥ S Eo A A s T ST oTwE— oSt pa ity 7
ot a+ama saadh A ot s ot bsy DA e o Aasr oA I asrg oy s sasoo
E o e e e e mp = A e e e [CAA == o ey Lo T oo S A R ST mE ey oS

Sec. 46-70. Repealed by Ord. No. 15,-—-- Limited access gates—and
leoeks—




3
x

|5
F.—l

it
H
N
b
i

H

il A 1an o o o oo N I BRI I PN o
= ATV J—Vt—/llt LLLUI T o LY el \/L—J, S N s s sy pupar Sy v T T
vt 1y cqrnt ] o iy rmatiliva I o+ sy anmtranll~d e Vale Pal ool VAt Rl

bl-l—\./b/ -L\—_Z’ [ g S U U A S Sy v g - L L P -y S e g CITAC TALL vV N L2 1o - OGO A L G e b/ LI W

oIt ey ot otz ~=owA condod lrnsy oA Av ot aw Ay~

4_\4\1@1;_4_4)3 T JX\JI, £2Y J T LAy R O ERY —I b/uu, = [P S 3 g S e gy A Voo — 7

Jaimast+ Ammm~ca oho1 ] SNxre 1o Iheasy vid+ e s moawAc codoo or

[ S Sy o o g Sy Wy T L [~} W 4T TITAV . 0 EEY FOL L2 S S e ERY Ju, R = \/Md—\.&u, o ATy =

asma ] e oOotrs o~ + e S~ oo Ar o711 haxre o 1 e s lross

[ e P o g g s W g = Vo T T lj\.llll LS S e w |\ [ e 4 - G S vy = TV L= [= Sy rF~4 2y F \_'j

P Tk e B R o I o W S UoX. S0 W) FASNI | Tacl beaveoe v Ieoacle by leasy ot xrad n A

L 9 S S~ e =9 th\/lAA_llg OV 0 A o wpn 3y - W xS A rd g T - I ~ r2Y I T oI v T o OCK

Aatvrisna achaT 1 e A [ +hs ovwtotdirmea dTeamsle Whasy lreasz s1oaA g

LV S Wy s S Ny w7 [ G L o apr v wy p— \Jrl o Sy oo R S Ty ) A== =r T =3 = =r—y t’.A.JJ-g == — J = < & Jl\ly T A )-lj

Fheo N MAaTrmao T nn Mmoo v~ Fyxrroomt g~ e Crntrall A N~ oo

L= T2 p ey T [ S g N P e o U\J}Jud_ L=raay T e LT 28 b/\,J—\JLA- P Y Sy up =y o S =Y T e T

ettt o thatr hoavus oamniritsz mnyreoocont D4 heoaaeo o Ao

FU_I—IIK—L—) SR g Qe Sy TICOV ~ LS O S SR Ey b—l-‘-\.f'n—’_\dllb [~ Py L g gy L= \.A\}J .

Sec. 46-72. Repealed by Ord. No. 15,-—-. Leecking fire department
T mrclinec Fira dopmavdmant commeedd on o ~ovme ol a1l e dnad a3 T ad )
_A_x\J\./]L—J-lAg J S MR S Wy \.A\./}/MA— [P gy g vy A= LTIl D Fe uut/u RIS e~ [ i SOy G W (R Ep S 1L

~ 7 1 o AT ot st S e ~ ) Pt =11 szt ot o e F1rea Aomavimeant

L e vy LTI bV LW N R W W SRy Wy RO U SR N g 3 =TT AT - 5 LwT k._i—llg [ S = M\Jt/“&_ [y 8y T

connectdarmoe that A notk P ST TR S I U N =W =

N i i (i G ) NI Wy wegp SR I R e S i W gy AT T LTI v V\.Ar/u - 14 b/..I_LA\_/ .

Sec. 46-73. Owner Notification for retroactive provisions.

(a) Upon the issuance of a building permit under chapter 26 of the
City Code and determination by the fire code official that
alterations are needed to the existing building to provide a
minimum degree of fire and life safety to persons occupying
said building, the property owner has three (3) calendar years
from the date of issuance of the building permit to comply
with the requirements of chapter 46—11 of the international
fire code in effect at the time of permit issuance that apply
to the building in question. If, at the end of the initial
three (3) year period, the fire code official determines that
the property owner has made substantial progress in bringing
the property into compliance, the fire code official may grant
a single two (2) year extension to the owner to complete such
work. If, however, the fire code official determines that
substantial progress has not been made by the property owner
by the end of the initial three (3) year period or, when
applicable, the property owner fails to complete the work
during the two (2) year extension period, then the property
will ©be subject to compliance with the retrocactive
requirements of chapter 46—11 in effect at the end of the
initial three (3) year period or, when applicable, the two (2)
year extension period that apply to the building in question.

(b) Upon determination by the fire code official that alterations
are needed to an existing building to provide a minimum degree
of fire and life safety to persons occupying said building
and/or to provide for fire prevention and response within said
building, the fire code official may require the property
owner to comply with some or all of the requirements of
chapter 11 of the international fire code in effect at the
time of such determination, and may reguire the property owner




to comply with the specified requirements within the time

period set forth in written notice given by the fire code

official to the property owner, not to exceed three (3)

calendar vears from the date of said notice.

Sec. 46-74, Securing fire-damaged premises within 48 hours after

fire event.

Section 110 of the international fire code is amended by

adding a new section 110.5 to read as follows:

Section 110.5 Securing fire-damaged premises within 48 hours

after fire event.

(a)

The following definitions apply to this section:

(b)

“Fire event” means a response by the Des Moines Fire
Department to extinguish a fire within a building,
dwelling or other structure that commences with the
dispatching of fire department resources and concludes
with the fire officer in charge terminating the incident.
“Fire-damaged structure” means a building, dwelling or
other structure within the corporate limits of the city
that has been partially burned during a fire event.
“"Nuisance” means injurious or dangerous to public safety,
and constituting an emergency reguiring immediate
abatement pursuant to article VI, chapter 42 of the city
code and/or other applicable city code section(s).
“Property owner” means the record titleholder(s) and/or
contract purchaser(s) of the real property upon which a
fire-damaged structure is located.

A fire-damaged structure in an unsecured condition may be

(c)

determined by a designated fire department official, in
his or her sole discretion, to constitute a nuisance.
The designated fire department official mav but is not

required to give notice to the property owner(s) of such
a determination of nuisance requiring immediate
abatement, and a hearing regarding the existence of the
nuisance pursuant to section 42-358.02(c) of this code
may be held if practical under the circumstances, but
shall not be required to be held if impractical under the
circumstances, prior to abatement of the nuisance by the
property owner or the citvy.

A fire-damaged structure determined to constitute a

nuisance shall be secured by the property owner(s), at
the property owner’s sole expense, in accordance with
this section and within forty-eight (48) hours of the
fire event, unless additional time is requested by the
property owner (s) and granted in writing by the
designated fire department official, in his or her sole
discretion.




(e) Prior to securing a fire-damaged structure determined to

constitute a nuisance, the property owner(s) shall remove
or cause to be removed all living beings from such
structure.

(£) The property owner(s) shall secure all windows, doors,

and other structural openings of the fire-damaged
structure determined to constitute a nuisance to prevent
access by unauthorized persons.

(g} A fire-damaged structure determined to constitute a

nuisance which cannot be properly secured from access to

the interior by the use of window locks, door locks,

padlocks, or other appropriate locking mechanisms, shall
be secured by the property owner(s) as follows:

(1) Completely enclosing over all structural openings
(windows, dcors, roof openings) on the exterior of
such fire-damaged structure with plywood; or

(2) Completely enclosing such fire-damaged structure
with a temporary snow fence of not less than forty-
eight (48”) inches in height; or

(3) By any different and/or additional measures set
forth in any written notice given by the designated
fire department official to the property owner(s).

(h) TIf the property owner(s) fails to secure a fire-damaged

structure determined to constitute a nuisance 1in
accordance with the requirements of this section, the
fire chief or his or her designee, which designee may
include the community development department director or
his or her designee, may cause such fire-damaged
structure to be secured and assess the costs thereof
against the real property upon which such fire-damaged
structure is located for collection in the same manner as
a property tax, following hearing in accordance with
article VI, chapter 42 of the city code and/or other
applicable city code sections.

(i) Property owner(s) shall be joint and severally liable for

performing the actions required by this section and for
any property assessments arising from failure to perform
such actions.

Section 46-75. Vacant Premises.

(a)

Section 311.1 of the internatiocnal fire code is amended to

read as follows:

311.1 General. Permanently or temporarily unoccupied

buildings, structures, premises or portions thereof,
including tenant spaces, shall be safeguarded and maintained
in accordance with Sections 311.1.1 through 311.5.5.




(b) Section 311.1.1 of the international fire code is amended to
read as follows:
311.1.1 Abandoned premises. Buildings, structures and premises
for which an owner cannot be identified or located by dispatch
of a certificate of mailing to the last known or registered
address, which persistently or repeatedly become unprotected
or unsecured, which have been occupied by unauthorized persons
or for illegal purposes, or which present a danger of
structural collapse or fire spread to adjacent properties may
be considered abandoned, declared unsafe and abated by
demolition or rehabilitation in accordance with chapters 26,
42 and/or 60 of the city code, as applicable.

(c) Section 311.1.2 of the international fire code is amended to
read as follows:
311.1.2 Tenant spaces. Storage and lease plans required by
this code shall be revised and updated by the persons owning
or in charge of control of tenant spaces to reflect temporary
or partial vacancies.

{d) Section 311.2 of the international fire code is amended to
read as follows:
311.2 Safegquarding vacant premises. Permanently and
temporarily unoccupied buildings, structures, premises or
portions thereof (collectively “premises”) shall be secured
and protected by persons owning or in charge or control of
such premises in accordance with Sections 311.2.1 through
311.2.3.

(e) Section 311.3 of the international fire code is amended to

read as follows:

311.3 Removal of combustibles. Persons owning, or in charge or
control of, a vacant building, structure, premises or portion
thereof (ccollectively “premises”), shall remove therefrom all
accumulations of combustible materials, flammable ox
combustible waste or rubbish and shall securely lock or
otherwise secure doors, windows and other openings to prevent
entry by unauthorized persons. The premises shall be
maintained clear of waste or hazardous materials.

Exceptions:

1. Buildings or portions of buildings undergoing additions.
alterations, repairs or change of occupancy in accordance
with the International Building Code, where waste 1is
controlled and removed as required by Section 304.




L£)

e e
HA

2. Seasonally occupied buildings.

Section 311.4 of the international fire code is amended to

read as follows:

311.4 Removal of hazardous materials. Persons owning or having
charge or control of a vacant building, structure, premises or
portion thereof containing hazardous materials requlated by
Chapter 50 shall comply with the facility closure requirements
of Section 5001.6.

Section 311.5 of the international fire code is amended to

(h)

read as follows:

311.5 Placards. Any vacant or abandoned buildings or
structures determined to be unsafe pursuant to Section 110 of
this code relating to structural or interior hazards may be
marked as required by Sections 311.5.1 through 311.5.5.

Section 311 of the international fire code is amended by

Secs.

Sec.

adding a new section 311.6 as follows:

The fire code official may
notify the person(s) owning, or in charge or control of, a
vacant building, structure, premises or portion thereof
(collectively “premises”) of failure to comply with any of the
requirements of Sections 311.2 to 311.4, and may reguire
compliance by such person(s) within the time set forth in the
notice., If compliance does not occur within the time set forth
in the notice, the fire chief or his or her designee may seck
available remedies, including but not limited to abatement and
assessment of costs pursuant to chapters 26, 42 and/or 60 of
the city code, as applicable.

Section 311.6 Compliance.

46~7446-76—46-90. Reserved.

ARTICLE VIII. FLAMMABLE AND COMBUSTIBLE LIQUIDS

46-246. Repealed by Ord. No. 15,---,

j83]

[E%)



ot

o
LI T

~ha~f i1l A e e
Wt =G

i Yl

of +he £

T

-

bt
TT

IToTroe

T

T f

o s g gy

IO

0}

IS IS

£l ormrmaind

1 man
[y
ot vl £

[ol R e ey y

SarTna

heo
VoL It oI ooy

ol1lce b don ok el W o]

1nt o

BPa

o
e

[ A o 1 T Y L e gy

o mpa = 2

TrIIT OO

o A
=" bd - LA

e gy

=
T

1 da

T o

il Sl
20 Ao

1

oy
TTTTTT

il s
VWITOTIT

i1 r~e
=4

Py g mra uy wy o ya g

mo sz

ro +han

e

of et

Sy e

Loy
TT
=

==

TITCIT

TICTIT

=

[allath ks i ilalal
v Lo

=

-+ k)
L S Vi e g

4ol do
lr\ju_{_uu

-

TTTN
T

o
p i

ol oo e
S gy e

I £
==

3

Retailing

Rt o

+

L)

1de 1
It

ot 0
>

3y

o P S e la.\ju_l_uu

TT ~» TTT.T
==

o

| ey e e

Yaa3
1~ 1}1,«.1..1\.4._1.;13

Iniga T A3
ot e nSy
ot LS |

=g =

r o ~AF ~Tl oo
T A==

-

iR atad

]

P s RS S e
of 28
L= ==

Ctromyarens

{20

T

=

oz onc o
ST

n

5
oTT

ik a¥ad

14

a1l A e b
T

g
A

==

Z

XV Fa VXX«

a0
T

vy o~
T gt—o+%
itk
wWIC Tt

ot
e

oo ant
cxCCTpP~T

af
p

FaShE il el
T T

ha¥al

o= 1]
oot

Ny et A
=3

ol A
WITCTT L 2 g i v

=
O

o g e

leooo
4 =~

Path
=

an ]l e e
\ju_}_;vllu

.
ik olh il aWai
T TIT TG

v

Rk aWa'd

[ iR oS PRk R L RVVIN NrasAac o Wlend

T IT T o o =&

Thea

(AN

[ s r p o gy 3 T u )

e E= e as iy

A=

1

e
or TTITNH

TT

T

T le oYy 99
== = = oy
LS S © g gy e gy S e i ey

B e =T~

firnich

e PR SN 1 WV N B o T

ailfa kil

1T
—

A= ey 3

SIS
St

L3 o & g

=

LTI T T T D

=

-7

TS

leoco

1

REE aWa S

ol alallwllalsihele SEet

R aWa'd

Ftha mmaowmarfa 4.9

FroTCToo Ty O B R ST or ST}

THO I T T o T =i 7

T

Q4

ol et i et Al ot B4
ot oTTOTTG Ty

La

N
T

Ao

q ey

Ar _oceambigetrilhl A 7
Py & 2 Y3330 B S g T O S T o T O T T oS

v At ) ol
SRS ESC s
toanlrs

(BN

ANF _onvtrl A b A
D =4 [0 Sy~ s oy ~ Wil

e
A% 3™

t T~ et ] x
corto— o e oy

It

PratTTi

=

or Nl asamont +anrl-o
+ ot

TS
+h e

oYX Mo

1. 000 o1l arma

4

ol oot o W F S o R oo o W B e il .4

oI T

=

ST TOITO

1=

A

7

L
£ +aoanl-o

peagw

ToTTT

= e
Inrnetr 213 o4

oroama
gEreanG

attheor ~Alerr
L3 = g G .y T LTI TT o S N Wy
e LT e = BT T A

=

T e T P Y
e

=

1A AT Tn T e
T

T

P B g AT Wy O o s g gy e

[AR)
Y7

v
=2y
taoanl

bl ikl
T Ty

DIE 11 A

C=

1

T
T

clacce T

ik aWad

1n
AR R g R = ap 22T

alal ok oltal

I it A
PN N 'ng_u\‘l.).\‘l

hel

g

G OTT

anle

7

of ono
T

===

Fatt Falalalal
T T

koY

TTTen  licdtda
L= 3 gu3ds
it 1A e

BRI EEIRY

=y

Alaaa
p == gy

TS
de~
Tt

ba

<

I o0

270l lean

Rk KTy

ol

onntoida

T

W = ST

A

X

| ey g ap w o ey

>

+h
T TTICT T

R e S e S S S raT N

o
e =

T

vy ] o s s
b/—l—uv\_flll.

T

EERy =g =}

E R Tl o o e B )

M=

=
[EIc SR ES

~

(A
7

T
==

wth ~l oo
oo

A=y

rond
ot

1A Ar Wl Aty A

btz ey

I7T ~» TTT

o g

T

T

T TOwW g oIy

T

|=swawy

o

v

=R

irements.

d tank requ

Special liqui

46-247.

Sec.

+&3> The storage of class I or II flammable or combustible liquids

zones 1 and 2, as

fire

in

hibited

is pro
46-2 of this chapter

boveground tanks

in a

an exception may be made

4

ion

t

.

in sec

defined

d approved by the

ing an

in writ

f requested

i

at a construction site

fire chief.

+anis

T Al A v v e A

hallact- e af

Ll B W d oOr

R oWl 2

Whon

(B

h
¥
i
e 4
L ¢
B
b Q
Q
P 4+
L o
B §
D
H @
M 4D
H @
b s
5 Q
o w
)]

&
)]
o

m

o
H -rH

Q

1)}

~t
P,
-
P Q
N
5 Q
Hom
‘_

B P
D

A
N
b

_.I.L

1M
AN
)
"

b 4b

-
5k
uaw

[¢
ur

-
P
&
F o
N

oach
AL TTT

sty of concryeatroas o

loaadt awme ~vadng ~

1nag—at

1

cont o

Fanl

TSy

A — -
Faoanls ah~71

=
[Rerrriy

TIIcTT Tt T y o oo

= vy e g o

ER R e e S A B

[Sf g o= o o 2y

The
Py

ranl
LT A g )

+ha
L= e

o
A=

L e I =L £
copa Ity

aogalloanal
G T TiTo

o0n
7 voT

of
1

redo

oxr
A= o

ot rano

el ae
| =% g g Sy =y 4

ot ol
[T Vel N e

Ty
numhe -
TIITOo T

s

mat

T
e aval
(= raTy

red o +h e~
PR SRS AS = [~ o a =

o ff

~r o~k
h=vey

+h e

faNaValhk ol
[S ANy v g o vy

2ot atr ol sy

+

ol Bl 2
[ g oy

1ot ant
[ 0 = W S SRR Sy N Sy
+h e~

foarmle 4+~
[ o> ue g g )
ol 17

T

oo T TITy

=
Cabhl e

=

T

he
=

[P 3 3 & o= v

ot roava
sJ‘—J_uLJAJ

P
=

LS =" ey 4

cuibhmeroand
Tt [CA== =2 1A S R oA o
e o4

Lih am
ARTY

ot
AT

h ol .22 WaY

i
toamA~A 4~

TIT T TS T3

nat ot ad Tha o
11l
T

el ]l

S A
TITINX

Ly
=TT

R Wl SV e |
TIIITY

nxr 'V'\QV‘-I hibd
PrerpeT=%

L vy

TIL T

=3

=TI

po g

1A2

T &

TIT

T

1=

1

oanlss
Iy

1o
ey

T T

Sam o armoent o f ~enm et o
ST e—C
Y’}'\ ]

PYyyesp e s aw ayy

ar

S o
TCTIE

g

ancher o
TIITCTIT

waith +he
=9 LA™ "R v TG

o
ey

+anl 1
ToEc

++he
T

WITTTYT

PRVl SV T W JN
TITT IO TS

I m
pIeippgrarsy e Ty

Ao man

FProyv T

nDrosIa

o
=

+anla ah 71

Yoo

oG
EAN +~ 2 000

mrndoroavaianA ot

=TT

Nirme otogsna £
S+
1

oanit

neot
I

= T [ o g o g agen o

TSI

= e

=g

142

[l Sid

=

TT

EETRPN

anll Ar o

+ ol
LA TTT

ho o £y
TTITTCTT =

e W)

+ o

loao

WO

,U\JU \jl.A_L_Lv.\JLJ,
amA D 1 /D
7

1=
EAASAY AREASAN MRS I S T P IS A= S R AS g &

A=)

o
2000 +~ 10 AN 21 1 Ana

=4

1

=4

L7 s
for +anla

= g

=

TTIITIIT

=y

far
TG

heo
=

ik Wl
TITOTT

=

=

A

TEITISD

heo
T CTI T

Lk aWai




a1 1 A e

28 _NNAN

10 _A0N +~

tarnl-o
TTTLITITT

=3 77 >4 ST oA T .

1

=

o
g

Trnet a1l AaA

[ M Gy DS W g e may Su o g

Ll E R e = B |
[y S g g o g ms A S
)

ha
T

mimno
A= =2Y ==

o
=y

v ot I

[ O =y n g gy e wp e v

Tl

oy
TTT

o
=y p ey

rommadts
=5t

()

=

AET ST T

IO

7 okl

1

[l ot ok P

on. tha
CIT

+roarmlro

FEE o Pa R e RN R R o

ExS

SRR AT A TSy TITTTy P2 IC T EIERA

T

T T T g =

w1 11

LA =

ol i

WIT T OTT

ke die B W
L= )

S vnas s v A
TP
A~ S A

vy
TTIT

ST

A1 oy
WLJLlJ-LA-L&\.&

v

e T W o

=g iy

S A Al eoermancaro

™I YN Ty

1f _+h

= ey

1.

o
TXTT

rratrs Ao

TS A & g e ey

TCTTOx

Ty

T

Fars

TIrt o T

L= gy

15, -—-.

No.

Sec.

Repealed by Ord.

46-249.

moan e e e

v At

ncoc

ol

YIT e
[=A =2 "I a==a—

et

Yhore

vl
T

=TT —g T

13

IT

=R S T

[y v oy wapss mp. v p i e

[ vy o s ey e s g

L3 e ey

nat
o+

o
-

~t s A e
[ " W U W G G oL S5 i g iy ey

-
[y

fa ds all e s on Y
=T SToTRT7
s ol W W e
i S N Ny Ry SR gy g e J

1

e~y

=
Ty =

arn s

OO IITN
[ Ja = e~y

a2
TLTITX

nukhl i~
P

L84

P

PR Rt ot i I

I

~r s
O 1T

PR I
T Xx

FE Wl o PN
TIT O T

haakath ¥
ey

vt e ]
[N W > g e iy

T L v

(AW SRS T 2 o
a=aSras

P B
=

+
EERSA o

fath o

e ritet ol o he AeordrmeseaA gd+h
oS Wt

coantralled Al armeamasyra

=

P31 g

A s o S

[ ey e e g

oSS TH=o©™
ot
=

o e o

T T

Ad ormean oy

LNV el
POt

o~
=4

4=

A

asret ~Am el Aviorae

Axrt 1 ernd o d
A2 L-.J.J.J.:j LAJ—ULJ-—Lle

SO pTThioTT

oo

1=

TTE TTITOW ST T

Favy

Ty T

The v~

A cormearmaod mes bt ol

e

orrevrihea oA + LAl ol e b i
oo ooty (== ¥

~ A
I

e

connaoect St s o

P o 3 i e gy

oo
not i For

L= A F I s R AT

T oToTT

1=

A W O e ey e e o o

choll

'F';V‘

mAann.o +
O ST

PR ot S|

Sy

iz A A

~ T e

=~
e

[ Rp o

oo Ty

T

I ol S

=XIT

L e s vy vy

=

Lo gy

[ g o i e =y

46-281.

Sec.

Location of containers.

=

liquefied
fire zone

PN od
district as defined in section 46-2

ahAal]
petrolevmgas—shail -+
No

13 Qd netrel miem ~vo o

T

fFor
J Surw aasn= " g iy

LR T ol o I
Wttt

coantadnaro
oot

1nal
g

COT T OOt

IIndeoeress

(a)

1 amdt
o e e 2 3 ey S

\/\/.-t_t/\/.n_\.A.L.
installation shall be permitted

1 and 2 of the fire

ocoaYrmoar ot o

+
oI

nermi et oad
[ S ) (I Sy Gy W g

)d
petroleum gas

nos.

1Y
2

in

unless specifically approved by the fire

chief on a temporary basis only or the containers are not

of this chapter,

and are

located outside a building,

used for cooking purposes only.

larger than 20 pounds,

The aggregate capacity of any one installation shall not

(b)

in

except that

limit may be altered at the

capacility,

of water

exceed 1,000 gallons

is
discretion of the chief of the fire prevention bureau after

installations th

particular

gas

lved. Bulk plants,
and larger

container charging operations,

invo
amounts of storage shall be governed by approved national

due consideration of all factors

utility plants,

iations.

standards and state regu

stage regulating equipment

shall be

other than buildings especially
except that small department of

transportation containers and regulating equipment may be used

and first
located outside of buildings,
provided for this purpose,

Containers

(c)

doors under the following conditions:

in

If temporarily used for demonstration purposes and

the container

pounds.

(1)

32—20

has a maximum water capacity of

If used with a completely self-contained gas hand

(2)
torch or

a

has

similar equipment and the container

ter capacity of 2 1/2 pounds.

maximum wa



3

ik ot
TS

ot +W~ £
=t

inatrollead £ sao~
UL S ATy Wy S S S N 3 [ S vy [ e ey T

not
TTorIIT T o ITo T
chald

£ ocarmt g
A3

U\’\Jruv\— A=
13tk 19 o+ a

Sty er

{2\

hifatalal
ST T T OTT

+he v ] o+

T

Ve T T P TS = B =N 64
T T Y o IITO &y

13xz

T Ty

L AV I s

of
o=

OTITE T

1T

e e e G

=~

1933 e
I ety

2

ot oA~ o

Sy e s A
R o e e~

RV BRI, o It
T

ot
[ S = oy e vy

L=

SR = T P A= = ey

PN N il = 11y
B— e sts T Ty
ool

On +Fhe e oo

A
P

dual conta

=

tadith v oes st b s
ToeoptttT— TITe

LT TTT

hall be located

iner s

divi

in

Each

(d)

in
1re

R 4

YL Y e

S/ v e

A

[T SR Sa e S

amrmoartant  ag
A_A.llb/ [ T O G G vy
ol N <
e

accordance with

code.

naAar~at
T o—

e Ty propTTtTty —

Table 6104.3 of the f

g

ey o g

poaeay

+ o]
LI S s N g vy

1l sl
T Y

pe s

T

1>

3

maoat e e
A2 = SR B & 3 Wy wey e sy o

ISR S I
TS =+

1 /4
7

+

v
b e W WaX o)
ToaTTTIE

A

4

{F

—5
50
125

h%al
T

2

FR Q= o=y g

e (e
i}

P

125
===

+h o

Toco

TIITLIT

= e e

=

0. 00N
[BR =2y an-a v
[oNATNATAYA)

V, LA™ A
wEAENATAN|

20 _N07 -~

Ty voU v

LI~ = v e =

1
o=

1O

Ineat 77 ~+

Lot R o W PaC o SN IR PN

=
=y

.
AR o A B o S Wk I ok B A G =)
WO =

oW o the ol Won dhms Y il o\

Tf +ha
o e

TIToTOo T tre Ot

=

£]77 > g S s ey e\ 3 g g - v o 3

g A=A e 7

T

[ g

.
O3 ot anea
oottt

coroaat e +the g

no or

o]

Ak}

T

IO LTI ITT

(=pEas
of +h

he B EA =
A

I

N R T
p=]

vy

=

TT o CtTr

chol 1

el 9 ey
S PETy TS

o]
ToioT

il

L ilat ol

et g
Pttt

+a

=3 o SR = i == mp =

S et akhalnl ol Bl

with +ha

commrm ] s
ST Y

[
Falal ol ulba)
=

T

TT

I

W It

[k g = e ey

I
o= Sgps ey
W

il o Wath ol
L P = mp 25 g e gy

L aVal%]

carya et i
—Ccapa Ty —Pes

+he
L 3

r +haonr
L™ g p Y

vt h
FTaterreE

b e W B B ool &2

Qoo eeat o o~

+he
(=p ¥ 2~

mada oo~k Inetr a1l at 3 A ch~11
llluu-\dl [ SR i S WUy Wy < it P VU U Ry S g e B

+ 277 ~4
[ SRS W R Wiy VI S P SO S S S S W R

fal

onoe Trnetr Tl o+ 3 A 3

+hanr

moro

E=a—
The

[ 3 §= g =

fornt
=

>y wy

TIT o o T T ST a

T
£ 2

It

hayy e oy

nxr a1 laosct 28
= ot oot r—u=s Ct= F e

Ll ata

R At ol o Wt ina
L9 I Sy e . g -

™m
E=ge = pyay

=

S OYN ot~ A
u\—h—/u-t—u\‘

ynd ceomdad o Anma st aenT v A
ToTt—aPpP=Y

S ESRA= T e

ST

diotancsa et oo an
I G ey ey wey & g 2

nat 217 o+

Ml NI mimm

L=y

SO TS

CITC oI T T

T L

=R

<

paym oy g arry s v s a2y

ipnstallations.
Containers

3

ISR EWal oY
[EA™

talled for use shall not be stacked one above

ins

(e)

the other. Containers of 1,000 gallons or less shall be set on

Concrete

to prevent tipping.

icient size

blocks or bricks shall not be used.

concrete pads of suff

e~

mateoariol o

combhiiat 1 1

2~
I

Artz v oo

oo
AR vy

Tal

romasras
E13avgn

=

[LF)
=

T

P33 Gy S e ny o e e S o g e

£IIT T w gwr gy v g e my

g

IS e =g

= 4

coantasanoy

lal a8 4
Iy

fonrt ~F

+harn + A
W o T T

103

3 3 S - e mp o o e gy

=

1>

T

TOTT




(gf) The minimum separation between liquefied petroleum gas
~ containers and flammable liguid tanks shall be 20 feet, and
the minimum separation between a container and the centerline

of the dike shall be ten feet.

ARTICLE X. TENTS
Sec. 46-316. Distance.
The distance requirements in Chapter 24—31 of the

International Fire Code may be lowered if approved in advance and
in writing by the fire chief or designee.

Sec. 46-318. Exception to Section 24633103.2.

Section 24033103.2 of the International Fire Code shall-keis
amended to include the following exception, with all other
provisions of said Section remaining the same:

(3) The aggregate area of 10-feet by 10-feet (10’x10’) tents,
with or without open sides, in any configuration, not to
exceed 1000 square feet (93 m?) total.

Section 2. This ordinance shall be in full force and effect

as of November 1, 2013, following passage and publication as

provided by law.

FORM APPROVED:

Mo £ Frand-

Ienna K. Frhnk
Assistant City Attorney




