

★ **Roll Call Number**

Agenda Item Number
40 E

Date May 19, 2008

WHEREAS, Fleet Maintenance requested the Finance Department Procurement Division to solicit bids for purchase of various replacement heavy duty trucks for city-wide use; and

WHEREAS, the Procurement Division solicited bids by advertisement and mailing Invitation to Bid V08-077 to ten (10) potential bidders with nine (9) bids received; and

WHEREAS, the low dollar compliant bids for ITEMS 1 and 2 were received from O'Halloran International, 3311 Adventureland Drive, Altoona, IA 50009, at a total cost of \$559,506.00; and

WHEREAS, the low dollar compliant bid for ITEM 3 was received from Trans-Iowa Equipment, 4607 SE Rio Court, Ankeny, IA 50021, at a total cost of \$190,292.00; and

WHEREAS, funding in the amount of \$676,508.00 is available through lease-purchase financing, and \$73,290.00 is available from CMO010407/Equipment Replacement; and

WHEREAS, the Procurement Administrator and the Fleet Maintenance Manager recommends approval of the low dollar compliant bids;

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that the Des Moines City Council hereby accepts and approves the aforementioned low dollar compliant bidders for various replacement heavy duty trucks at a total cost of \$749,798.00, subject to obtaining the necessary financing through the City's master lease-purchase agreement with Bank of America, Supplement C-1.

(Council Communication No. 08-307)
Moved by _____ to adopt

W Approved as to form:

Ann DiDonato
Ann DiDonato
Assistant City Attorney

COUNCIL ACTION	YEAS	NAYS	PASS	ABSENT
COWNIE				
COLEMAN				
HENSLEY				
KIERNAN				
MAHAFFEY				
MEYER				
VLASSIS				
TOTAL				
MOTION CARRIED			APPROVED	
_____ Mayor				

CERTIFICATE

I, DIANE RAUH, City Clerk of said City hereby certify that at a meeting of the City Council of said City of Des Moines, held on the above date, among other proceedings the above was adopted.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have hereunto set my hand and affixed my seal the day and year first above written.

_____ City Clerk

CITY OF DES MOINES - DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE - PURCHASING DIVISION

Heavy Duty Trucks Fleet Maintenance Bid No. V08-077

Opened: 04/10/08 Opened by: mv Req. # 16059,16060,16061

Bidder: O'Halloran International, Inc.
 Address: 3311 Adventureland Drive
 City: Des Moines, IA 50009
 Terms: Net 30
 FOB:
 Delivery:

	Base Bid #1	Base Bid #2	Alternate Bid #1	Alternate Bid #2
ITEM 1				
1 Each - 56,000 GVW Tandem Axle Truck				
Cab/Chassis Make/Model/Year	International WorkStar, 2009	International WorkStar, 2009	International WorkStar, 2009	International WorkStar, 2009
Snow Plow Make/Model	Monroe MP41R11	Henderson RSP42-11	Monroe MP41R11	Henderson RSP42-11
Patrol Wing Make/Model	Monroe 9'	Henderson HPW-9"	Monroe 9'	Henderson HPW-9'
Scraper Make/Model	Monroe4 MF-510	HendersonFA Scraper	Monroe MF-510	HendersonFA Scraper
Sprayer Make/Model	Monroe MSV-189-84-56	Vari Tech Ind. 103	Monroe MSV-189-84-56	Vari Tech Ind. 130
Less Trade Allowance: Unit #530	(\$24,000.00)	(\$24,000.00)	(\$24,000.00)	(\$24,000.00)
ITEM 1 NET TOTAL	\$194,506.00	\$170,118.00	\$179,438.00	\$155,050.00

	Base Bid #1	Base Bid #2	Alternate Bid #1	Alternate Bid #2
ITEM 2				
2 Each - 56,000 GVW Tandem Axle Trucks				
Cab/Chassis Make/Model/Year	International WorkStar, 2009	International WorkStar, 2009	International WorkStar, 2009	International WorkStar, 2009
Snow Plow Make/Model	Monroe MP41R11	Henderson RSP42-11	Monroe MP41R11	hendersonRSP42-11
Patrol Wing Make/Model	Monroe 9'	Henderson HPW-9"	Monroe 9'	Henderson HPW-9'
Scraper Make/Model	Monroe MF-510	HendersonFA Scraper	Monroe MF-510	HendersonFA Scraper
Dump Body Make/Model	Hilbilt 17	Henderson Mark 17	Hilbilt 17	Henderson Mark 17
Tarping System Make/Model	Hawkeye	Pull Tarps Twin Cable	Hawkeye	Pull Tarps Twin Cable
Spreader Make/Model	Monroe MSV-189-84-56	Henderson FSA III 304SS	Monroe MSV-189-84-56	Henderson FSA III 304SS
Less Trade Allowance: Unit #602	(\$16,000.00)	(\$16,000.00)	(\$16,000.00)	(\$16,000.00)
Less Trade Allowance: Unit #606	(\$20,500.00)	(\$20,500.00)	(\$20,500.00)	(\$20,500.00)
ITEM 2 NET TOTAL	\$401,500.00	\$360,536.00	\$371,364.00	\$330,400.00

	Base Bid #1	Base Bid #2	Alternate Bid #1	Alternate Bid #2
ITEM 3				
1 Each - 33,000 GVW Truck Mounted Street Sweeper				
Cab/Chassis Make/Model/Year	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Sweeper Make/Model	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Less Trade Allowance: Unit #602				
Less Trade Allowance: Unit #606				
ITEM 3 NET TOTAL				

CITY OF DES MOINES - DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE - PURCHASING DIVISION

Heavy Duty Trucks Fleet Maintenance Bid No. V08-077

Opened: 04/10/08 Opened by: mv Req. # 16059, 16060, 16061

Bidder: Peterbilt of Des Moines
 Address: 3445 Adventureland Drive
 City: Altoona, IA 50009
 Terms: NO RESPONSE FROM:
 FOB: Housby Mack
 Delivery: 120 days Kenworth Mid-Iowa
 McKenna Truck Center
 Elliott EQ. Co.
 Mid-Iowa Solid Waste EQ.

ITEM 1
 1 Each - 56,000 GVW Tandem Axle Truck \$201,335.00
 Cab/Chassis Make/Model/Year Peterbilt 367, 2009
 Snow Plow Make/Model Monroe MP41R11
 Patrol Wing Make/Model Monroe 9'
 Scraper Make/Model Monroe MF510
 Sprayer Make/Model Monroe

Less Trade Allowance: Unit #530 (\$5,000.00)
 ITEM 1 NET TOTAL \$196,335.00

ITEM 2
 2 Each - 56,000 GVW Tandem Axle Trucks \$207,579.00
 Cab/Chassis Make/Model/Year Peterbilt 367, 2009
 Snow Plow Make/Model Monroe
 Patrol Wing Make/Model Monroe
 Scraper Make/Model Monroe
 Dump Body Make/Model Hilbilt
 Tarping System Make/Model Hilbilt
 Spreader Make/Model Monroe

Less Trade Allowance: Unit #602 (\$4,000.00)
 Less Trade Allowance: Unit #606 (\$4,000.00)
 ITEM 2 NET TOTAL \$407,158.00

ITEM 3
 1 Each - 33,000 GVW Truck Mounted Street Sweeper NO BID
 Cab/Chassis Make/Model/Year
 Sweeper Make/Model